
Headphones
Hi-X15

The Hi-X15 closed-back headphones are the
workhorse of the award-winning Austrian
Audio Hi-X series, bringing the crystal-clear
and precise listening experience of High
Excursion technology to everyday use at an
unbeatable price.Reach for Hi-X15
headphones when you need reliable sound
and know things might get a little rough. Their
sophisticated folding design, rare in this price
range, means theyíre easy to store and carry,
and their durable all-metal hinge and bow
mean theyíre extremely robu...

Hi-X15 AUA0026 RRP: £82.50

Hi-X20

Introducing the Austrian Audio Hi-X20, the
newest member of our professional
headphone lineup. Designed with audio
professionals, content creators, and music
enthusiasts in mind, the Hi-X20 delivers
high-precision sound in a compact, affordable
form factor. Whether you're recording,
mixing, or just enjoying your favourite music,
the Hi-X20 is your reliable, day-to-day
companion.

Hi-X20 Headphones AUA0069 RRP: £99.99

Hi-X25BT

Our Hi-X25BT closed-back Bluetooth
headphones are a pro-level hybrid. You
decide how you want to connect via analogue
or digital, wired or wirelessly. Enjoy the
precision and clarity of award-winning High
Excursion technology wherever you are.
Hybrid convenience at the professional level
designed and engineered Austria.Hi-X25BT
headphones set the standard in connectivity.
They offer a classic analogue connection via
jack, a digital connection via USB-C, and
absolute freedom wirelessly via Blueto...

Hi-X25BT AUA0027 RRP: £116.66

Hi-X50

Professional closed-back on-ear
headphones. High Excursion proprietary
drivers designed for today's contemporary
music production. All metal hinges and bow
for maximum durability, ensuring maximum
durability and stability. Detachable cable, for
replaceability, compact portability and safety
from damage. Foldable construction, for
maximum portability and easy storage. Soft
slow retention memory foam earpads
providing greatest comfort during long
sessions.  44mm Hi-X driver. 3.5mm to 1/4
inch adapter. Frequency range: 5 Hz - 28
kHz. Sensitivity: 118dBspl/V. THD (@ 1kHz):
< 0.1%. Impedance: 25 . Input Power: 150
mW. Cable (detachable): 3m. Weight (without
cable): 285g.

Hi-X50 ON-EAR AUA0006 RRP: £165.83

Hi-X55

Professional closed-back over ear
headphones. High Excursion proprietary
drivers designed for today's contemporary
music production. All metal hinges and bow
for maximum durability, ensuring maximum
durability and stability. Detachable cable, for
replaceability, compact portability and safety
from damage. Foldable construction, for
maximum portability and easy storage. Soft
slow retention memory foam earpads
providing greatest comfort during long
sessions.  44mm Hi-X driver. 3.5mm to 1/4
inch adapter. Frequency range: 5 Hz - 28
kHz. Sensitivity: 118dBspl/V. THD (@ 1kHz):
< 0.1%. Impedance: 25 . Input Power: 150
mW. Cable (detachable): 3m. Weight (without
cable): 305g.

Hi-X55 OVER-EAR AUA0007 RRP: £249.17

Hi-X60

Austrian Audio has extended its highly
successful Hi-X6 headphone range with the
addition of the Hi-X60 model - a professional
headphone for recording, mixing and
mastering.Featuring the sonic signature of
the Hi-X6 series, with its natural and spacious
sound, the Hi-X60 over-ear, closed-back
design is ideally suited for use in loud
environments, for example, in the studio or
front-of-house (FOH).The Hi-X60 is
manufactured in Vienna, Austria, utilizing the
very best design and craftsmanship. The...

Hi-X60 Headphones AUA0033 RRP: £266.66

Hi-X65

HI-X65 PROFESSIONAL OPEN-BACK
STUDIO HEADPHONES FOR MIXING AND
MASTERINGDelightfully RevealingWe
created our new Hi-X65 open-back
headphones with mixing and mastering in
mind. They’re built to satisfy the need for
close, precise listening at these critical stages
of the audio production process. The same
qualities that make them great for
professional audio production also make
them perfect for audiophiles who appreciate
hearing every shade of nuance in the music
they love.High Precision Meets...

Hi-X65 AUA0025 RRP: £266.66

Headsets
PB17

Professional Business Headset for Office and
LeisureProfessional sound quality is an asset
in the office and business environment. The
sonic detail and fatigue-free listening of the
PB17 closed-back headphone assists
work-focussed tasks. Austrian Audio's High
Excursion (Hi-X) technology offers
exceptional speech intelligibility for calls and
crystal-clear sound.The PB17 shares the
same technology as the highly-regarded
Hi-X65, Hi-X55 and Hi-X50 pro audio
headphones for exceptional high-definitio...

PB17 Headset AUA0035 RRP: £132.50
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PG16

Professional Gaming HeadsetHigh-quality
pro sound for discerning gamers The
Austrian Audio Pro Gaming Headset PG16
offers you everything you need as a real
gamer. First and foremost, crystal clear,
high-resolution sound with perfect spatiality,
which allows you to precisely locate even the
quietest details. No opponent creeps up
unnoticed and you get a clear edge on the
virtual battlefield. The spectacular sound
experience is provided by the 44mm Hi-X
drivers celebrated by the trade press. So yo...

PG16 Headset AUA0034 RRP: £132.50

Microphones
OC818 Studio Set

The OC818 is a premium-grade studio mic
featuring a multi-pattern, dual output design.
At the heart of the microphone is a
handmade CKR12 ceramic capsule. This
custom edge-terminated capsule is hand-built
in Vienna, delivering exceptional sonic clarity
and an extended frequency range. Dual
outputs allow you to record each diaphragm
separately. Two analogue filters and two
attenuation pads. The PolarPilot app allows
wireless control over the analogue signal in
real time, with the ability to save and recall
settings. PolarDesigner plugin provides more
control with 1-5 crossover bands.  The Studio
Set includes OC818 mic, spider mount, pop
shield, mini XLR cable and mic clip.

OC818 Studio Set AUA0002 RRP: £832.50

OC818 - BLACK - Studio Set AUA0036 RRP: £832.50

OC18 Dual Set Plus

A one diaphragm, cardioid version of the
flagship OC818 with the signature ckr12
capsule that is a modern reproduction of the
ck12 capsule found in the now classic and
much sought after C414 models. Matched
Pair, full optional version.

OC18 Dual Set Plus AUA0022 RRP: £1,165.83

OC818 Dual Set Plus

At the heart of the revolutionary OC818 and
OC18 are equally passionate commitment to
sound and engineering excellence. Each of
these Large Diaphragm Condenser (LDC)
microphones has a handcrafted Austrian
Audio CKR12 ceramic capsule as its heart.
There are very few people that can design,
let alone construct, a classic edge-terminated
capsule. 

OC818 Dual Set Plus AUA0016 RRP: £1,665.83

OC818 Dual Set Plus (Black) AUA0060 RRP: £1,665.83

OC18 Studio Set

Precision cardioid large diaphragm
condenser microphone, handmade in Vienna.
 The OC18 is a single diaphragm version of
the OC818.  it has the same handmade
CKR12 ceramic capsule design, no
microprocessor, wireless control or Preset
mode.  Every OC18 and OC818 is
manufactured within 1dB of each other so
any two microphones can make a stereo pair
- add an OC18 to an OC818 to create a
spaced pair.  The Studio Set includes one
OC18, spider mount, mic clip and windshield.

OC18 Studio Set AUA0004 RRP: £540.83

OC16

Microsoft Word -
OC16_Specsheet_ENG.docxWith the OC16,
Austrian Audio introduces a brand-new
microphone in the "Open Condenser"
large-diaphragm series equipped with Open
Acoustics technology.The transparent and
natural sound of OC microphones, which has
been highly praised by the press and users,
is the result of the combination of the
patented CKR capsule and the "Open
Acoustics" design approach developed by
Austrian Audio.The OC16 is an extremely
flexible all-rounder and it can be used on a
wi...

OC16 Studio Set AUA0037 RRP: £283.33

CC8 Studio Set

The CC8 cardioid, true condenser,
small-diaphragm microphone is hand-built in
Vienna and created with professionals in
mind. At the heart of the Austrian Audio CC8
microphone beats the brand new OCC7
condenser capsule. Inspired by the legendary
CK1, the OCC7 delivers all the benefits of
that classic design updated to meet the
demands of today.

CC8 Studio Set AUA0028 RRP: £329.16

CC8 Stereo Set

The CC8 cardioid, true condenser,
small-diaphragm microphone is hand-built in
Vienna and created with professionals in
mind. At the heart of the Austrian Audio CC8
microphone beats the brand new OCC7
condenser capsule. Inspired by the legendary
CK1, the OCC7 delivers all the benefits of
that classic design updated to meet the
demands of today.

CC8 Stereo Set AUA0029 RRP: £658.33
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OC7

Austrian Audio proudly introduces the
OC7 true condenser microphone, optimised
for use on instruments. The mic is handmade
in Vienna and subjected to the strictest
quality assurance processes. The OC7
features the OCC7 small diaphragm capsule,
also handmade in Vienna. As to be expected
from Austrian Audio, this mic comes with
some special features:Most noticeable is the
"Swivel Joint" mechanism. Musicians and
sound techs are familiar with the problem of
microphone stands that...

OC7 Microphone AUA0039 RRP: £324.99

OD5

Austrian Audio proudly introduces the OD5
active-dynamic microphone, optimised for
use on instruments.The mic is handmade in
Vienna and subjected to the strictest quality
assurance processes. As to be expected
from Austrian Audio, these mics come with
some special features:Most noticeable is the
"Swivel Joint" mechanism. Musicians and
sound techs are familiar with the problem of
microphone stands that are screwed on too
tightly and can hardly be reached in the forest
of stands on stage. Once you...

OD5 Microphone AUA0040 RRP: £199.99

OC707

The handheld OC707 True Condenser Vocal
Microphone brings professional sound quality
to both studio and stage. Capturing every
nuance of your performance through the
world-renowned Austrian Audio
craftsmanship, your voice will delight your
audience. Designed to capture the dynamics
and subtleties of the human voiceThe OC707
blocks out unwanted noise from the outset,
while giving your voice a great depth of
volume. The OC707 lets the vocal cut
through the mix, clear, detailed and natural.
The wel...

OC707 Microphone AUA0023 RRP: £324.99

OD505

The OD505 Active Dynamic Vocal
Microphone is Austrian Audio’s all-rounder
microphone and features exquisite Viennese
craftsmanship. With it’s
Active-Dynamic-Technology, the OD505 is
designed primarily for the stage, though it is
also a very capable microphone for studio
application. Uncompromisingly robust, it
combines all the advantages of a dynamic
microphone with the tonal finesse of a
condenser microphone.Featuring Open
Acoustics TechnologyFeaturing Austrian
Audio’s proprietary Open Ac...

OD505 Microphone AUA0024 RRP: £199.99

OD303

Austrian Audio OD303 Dynamic Vocal
MicrophoneMaximum performance at an
attractive price.Looking for the best possible
sound for the stage?  You'll find it with the
OD303, the latest dynamic vocal microphone
from Austrian Audio. Austrian Audio has
designed a stage microphone that
concentrates on the absolute essentials: the
best sound for your voice! The well-balanced,
open, but at the same time powerful sound is
unparalleled at this price point.  With its
rugged con...

OD303 Microphone AUA0038 RRP: £82.50

OC707 WL1

Professional Wireless Studio Sound For Your
Performance - True Condenser Wireless
Microphone Capsule for Shure wireless
systems.

OC707 WL1 AUA0041 RRP: £324.99

OD505 WL1

 The OD505 WL1 is the ideal solution for all
those who are mobile during their
performance and depend on a wireless
system, but want to retain

OD505 WL1 AUA0042 RRP: £199.99

MiCreator

MiCreator Studio

The Austrian Audio MiCreator Studio isn’t
your typical desktop microphone. Featuring
intuitive user controls, direct headphone
monitoring and input for an additional mic -
like the optional MiCreator Satellite - or
instrument, the MiCreator Studio combines
top notch audio of a condenser mic with the
versatility of a simple audio interface with
USB-C® connectivity. 

MiCreator Studio Microphone AUA0057 RRP: £157.50

MiCreator Satellite

Designed for seamless pairing with MiCreator
Studio, the MiCreator Satellite microphone
unlocks powerful creative flexibility. Link
Satellite and MiCreator Studio via the in/out
ports to track two sound sources. Achieve
true stereo recordings and capture the
energy of the moment. MiCreator Satellite
even works as a standalone mic and offers
an extra headphone jack - ideal for interview
situations. Start recording how you want,
when you want with MiCreator Satellite.

MiCreator Satellite Microphone  AUA0058 RRP: £74.17
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MiCreator Y-Lav

Turn your MiCreator Studio into a mobile
content creation powerhouse with MiCreator
Y-Lav. Record two interview partners
simultaneously by tethering Y-Lav to your
MiCreator Studio. And hear your audio in
realtime via the additional headphone jack on
the MiCreator Y-Lav. No matter what you
create, make sure it sounds as good as it
looks with Y-Lav.

MiCreator Y-Lav Microphone  AUA0049 RRP: £40.83

MiCreator System Set

Includes MiCreator Studio and Satellite
Microphones, MiniBar stereo bar, swappable
faceplates and case.

MiCreator System Set AUA0056 RRP: £232.50

Microphone Accessories
OCR8 Bluetooth Remote

The OCR8 is a bluetooth dongle that can be
fitted to the rear of an OC818. This unique
feature allows for a previously unheard of 255
discrete polar patterns between
figure-of-eight, through all of the cardioid
versions and into omnidirectional. The free
control software, PolarPilot, will be available
for iOS and Android. This all occurs in the
analogue domain and there is no processing
or conversion of the mic’s signal to digital.

OCR8 Bluetooth Remote AUA0008 RRP: £116.66

OCS8 Shock Mount Spider

Spider Mount for OC818/OC18 

OCS8 Shock Mount Spider AUA0009 RRP: £74.99

OCH8 Mic Clip Holder

Mic Clip for OC818/OC18 (packed in bag)

OCH8 Mic Clip Holder AUA0012 RRP: £22.49

OCC8 Mini XLR Cable + Clip

Mini XLR Cable for OC818, with clip (packed in bag)

OCC8 Mini XLR Cable + Clip AUA0011 RRP: £24.16

OCW8 Windshield

Foam Windshield for OC818/OC18 (packed in bag)

OCW8 Windshield AUA0010 RRP: £22.49

OCP8 Pop Filter

Pop Filter (blister packed)

OCP8 Pop Filter AUA0015 RRP: £30.83

OCDC1

With the practical OCDC1 aluminium case,
everything is at hand for the use of Austrian
Audio large diaphragm microphones. The
custom foam insert provides space for 2
microphones, 2 elastic mounts and all
accessories.

OCDC1 Dual Case AUA0020 RRP: £74.99

SB1 Stereo Bar

The SB1 Stereo Bar is a dual-mounting bar
for two Austrian Audio microphones for
stereo recording.

SB1?Stereo Bar AUA0021 RRP: £37.49

Headphone Accessories
HXC3 Cable

3 Metre Cable for Hi-X55/50 (packed in bag)

HXC3 Cable AUA0017 RRP: £16.66

HXC1M2 Cable

1.2 Metre Cable for Hi-X55/50 (packed in bag)

HXC1M2 Cable AUA0018 RRP: £12.49

Austrian Audio HXHC Headphone Case

For Austrian Audio HiX headphones
Separate cable compartment in the lid
Dimensions: 360 x 253 x 80 mm
Weight: 235 g

HXHC Headphone Case AUA0030 RRP: £24.99

Hi-X65 Cushion Replacement Kit

Hi-X65 Cushion Replacement Kit - Includes 1
pair ear pads including foam net pad, 1 piece
head pad and assembly tool

Hi-X65CUK Cushion Replacement Kit for
Hi-X65

AUA0031 RRP: £49.99
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Hi-X50 Cushion Replacement Kit

Hi-X50 Cushion Replacement Kit - Includes 1
pair ear pads, 1 head pad and assembly tool.

Hi-X50CUK Cushion Replacement Kit for
Hi-X50

AUA0032 RRP: £49.99

Hi-X55 Cushion Replacement Kit

Austrian Audio Hi-X55 Cushion Kit - Includes
1 pair ear pads including foam net pad, 1
head pad and assembly tool.

Hi-X55CUK Cushion Replacement Kit for
Hi-X55

AUA0019 RRP: £49.99

Hi-XBCUK

Cushion replacement kit for the Austrian
Audio Hi-X15, Hi-X25BT, PG16 & PB17
headphones and headsets.

Hi-XBCUK Cushion Replacement Kit AUA0048 RRP: £16.66

HXC1m4 (TRS)

Austrian Audio HXC1m4 cable is a spare
cable to connect to your Austrian Audio
Hi-X15 headphones. TRS 2.5mm to TRS
3.5mm.

HXC1m4 Cable (TRS) AUA0047 RRP: £12.49

HXCA1m4 (USB-C)

Austrian Audio HXCA1m4 cable is a spare
cable to connect to your Austrian Audio
Hi-X25BT headphones. USB-C to TRS
3.5mm.

HXCA1m4 Cable (USB-C) AUA0046 RRP: £12.49

HXC1m2 (Black)

This is a replacement cable for the Austrian
Audio Hi-X60/65 headphones, coming in a
black colour and a 3.5 mm Jack plug with
thread-locking screw.

HXC1m2 black Cable AUA0045 RRP: £12.49
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